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FLORIDA RESOURCE MANAGEMENT
383 INTERSTATE BLVD.
SARASOTA, FL 34240
PHONE: 941.343.6160 FAX: 941.343.6118

INVOICE
Invoice No
Invoice Date
Check Date
Period Ending
Payroll Number
Customer Number
DeliveryGary Moyer

Harmony CDD
610 Sycamore St Ste 140

02-1291
12910024

10/08/2017
10/13/2017
10/13/2017

Email All

Celebration, FL 34747

51308
Page 1 of 1

Method ACH
ACH Draft Date 10/12/2017

5

Phone:407-566-1935  Fax:407-566-2064

1245.43FL 9014 BUILDING/CLEANER 6159.32 7,404.75
    GROSS PAYROLL AMOUNT 7,404.756159.32 1245.43
Returned Deduction Health Insurance -222.94Employee:     222.94
Returned Deduction VISION - Pretax -10.00Employee:      10.00
TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE 7,171.81

Description Charge

Items Processed:
Checks Printed:

Starting Check:
Ending Check:

Total Amount Due 7,171.81

5
5

459961
459965

WagesState  Code Total Charge
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FLORIDA RESOURCE MANAGEMENT
383 INTERSTATE BLVD.
SARASOTA, FL 34240
PHONE: 941.343.6160 FAX: 941.343.6118

INVOICE
Invoice No
Invoice Date
Check Date
Period Ending
Payroll Number
Customer Number
DeliveryGary Moyer

Harmony CDD
610 Sycamore St Ste 140

02-1291
12910023

09/24/2017
09/29/2017
09/29/2017

Email All

Celebration, FL 34747

50830
Page 1 of 1

Method ACH
ACH Draft Date 09/28/2017

5

Phone:407-566-1935  Fax:407-566-2064

1363.03FL 9014 BUILDING/CLEANER 6740.91 8,103.94
    GROSS PAYROLL AMOUNT 8,103.946740.91 1363.03
Returned Deduction Health Insurance -222.94Employee:     222.94
Returned Deduction VISION - Pretax -10.00Employee:      10.00
TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE 7,871.00

Description Charge

Items Processed:
Checks Printed:

Starting Check:
Ending Check:

Total Amount Due 7,871.00

5
5

455180
455184

WagesState  Code Total Charge
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FLORIDA RESOURCE MANAGEMENT
383 INTERSTATE BLVD.
SARASOTA, FL 34240
PHONE: 941.343.6160 FAX: 941.343.6118

INVOICE
Invoice No
Invoice Date
Check Date
Period Ending
Payroll Number
Customer Number
DeliveryGary Moyer

Harmony CDD
610 Sycamore St Ste 140

02-1291
12910022

09/10/2017
09/15/2017
09/15/2017

Email All

Celebration, FL 34747

50369
Page 1 of 1

Method ACH
ACH Draft Date 09/14/2017

5

Phone:407-566-1935  Fax:407-566-2064

1212.10FL 9014 BUILDING/CLEANER 5994.52 7,206.62
    GROSS PAYROLL AMOUNT 7,206.625994.52 1212.10
Returned Deduction Health Insurance -222.94Employee:     222.94
Returned Deduction VISION - Pretax -10.00Employee:      10.00
TOTAL FOR THIS INVOICE 6,973.68

Description Charge

Items Processed:
Checks Printed:

Starting Check:
Ending Check:

Total Amount Due 6,973.68

5
5

450708
450712

WagesState  Code Total Charge
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District Name:

Date:

Invoice Number:

Please issue a check to: 

Vendor Name:

Vendor No.:

Check amount:

Please cut check from Acct. #: 

Please code to: 

Check Description/Reason:  

Mailing instructions:

Due Date for Check:

Requestor:

Manager's Approval:

Date:

CHECK REQUEST FORM

HARMONY CDD

09/13/17

090817

Gerhard van der snel

$76.75

general fund

Hurricane Irma gas for district.

mail to Gerhard

next check run

Gerhard van der snel
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           Approved G v/d Snel 09/12/2017
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From: Walter, Chuck  
Sent: Wednesday, September 13, 2017 12:54 PM 
To: Chalkley, Sally <Sally.Chalkley@stservices.com>; Gerhard van der snel 
<gerhardharmony@gmail.com>; Cessna, Tiziana <Tiziana.Cessna@STServices.com> 
Subject: RE: Gas receipt Hurricane Prep 

 
approved 
 
From: Chalkley, Sally  
Sent: Wednesday, September 13, 2017 9:29 AM 
To: Gerhard van der snel <gerhardharmony@gmail.com>; Cessna, Tiziana 
<Tiziana.Cessna@STServices.com>; Walter, Chuck <Chuck.Walter@stservices.com> 
Subject: RE: Gas receipt Hurricane Prep 

 
Hi Gerhard, 
 
Attached is a check request for your reimbursement.  Please supply the coding. 
 
Chuck,  Please sign and email back to me for processing. 
 
Thank you 
 
Make it a good day, 
 
Sally Chalkley 
Accounts Payable and Payroll Specialist 
Severn Trent – North America 
210 N. University Drive,  Suite 702 | Coral Springs, FL 33071 
Office: 954.603.0033, ext. 40518 | www.severntrentservices.com 
 
From: Gerhard van der snel [mailto:gerhardharmony@gmail.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, September 12, 2017 4:28 PM 
To: Chalkley, Sally <Sally.Chalkley@stservices.com>; Cessna, Tiziana <Tiziana.Cessna@STServices.com>; 
Walter, Chuck <Chuck.Walter@stservices.com> 
Subject: Gas receipt Hurricane Prep 

 

Hello all, 
 
In my endless effort to get gas for the CDD vehicles on the night before the Hurricane, I 
had to use my personal credit card. The CDD debit card would not work. 
Can you please prepare a return funds check to my name? 
 
 
Thanks! 
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Have a great day! 

 

Gerhard van der Snel 

 

Field Operations Manager 

Harmony  CDD 

7360 Five Oaks Drive 

Harmony Fl 34773 

407-301-2235 
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Account Statement
Commercial Account
HARMONY CDDCustomer Service:

myhomedepotaccount.com
Account Inquiries:
1-800-685-6691    Fax 1-800-266-7308

Payment Information
Current Due $50.00

Past Due Amount   + $0.00

Minimum Payment Due   = $50.00

Payment Due Date 10/03/17           

Summary of Account Activity
Previous Balance $69.91CR

Payments -$0.00
Credits -$92.21
Purchases +$482.30
Debits +$0.00
FINANCE CHARGES +$0.00
Late Fees +$0.00
New Balance $320.18

Send Notice of Billing Errors and Customer Service Inquiries to:
HOME DEPOT CREDIT SERVICES
PO Box 790345, St. Louis, MO 63179-0345

This Account is Issued by Citibank, N.A.NOTICE: SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR IMPORTANT INFORMATION Page 1 of 6 8 CL 3

HARMONY CDD
ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
STE 702
210 N UNIVERSITY DR
CORAL SPRINGS, FL   33071-7320

Statement Enclosed

Your Account Number is  xxxx xxxx xxxx 5353 

Payment Due Date October 3, 2017

New Balance $320.18

Past Due Amount $0.00

Minimum Payment Due $50.00 

Print address changes on the reverse side.
Make Checks Payable to 

       Please detach and return lower portion with your payment  to insure proper credit.  Retain upper portion for your records.        

HOME DEPOT CREDIT SERVICES
DEPT. xx - xxxxxx5353
PO BOX 9001030
LOUISVILLE, KY  40290-1030

Account Number:  xxxx xxxx xxxx 5353 

Credit Limit $2,500
Credit Available         $2,179 
Closing Date 09/07/17
Next Closing Date 10/08/17

Days in Billing Period 30
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Change of Address
Please print address changes in blue or black ink. 

Page 2 of 6

T10636 - CL - 9196-1400-0004-//- NOPLAY -//-  - 0 -  - 86 - 000 -//- P -  - 0 - N -//- 0 -  - 0 - 0 -//-  12/31/99 - 07/01/04 - August 8, 2017 -//-  - WC - 0 - 0 -
N -  -  -  -//- 0 -   -  - T09B 
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Account:  **** **** **** 5353 

Page 3 of 6 1-800-685-6691   myhomedepotaccount.com

SPECIAL NOTICE

Don't forget, 1-Year Returns credited back to your Home Depot Card*

Additional benefits available to Commercial Card Holders:
• 60-day Terms: Take 60 days to pay before finance charges start to bill on every qualifying purchase
• Fuel savings: Earn Fuel savings for every $100 of qualifying purchases madeusing your The Home Depot Commercial Revolving Card 

Visit homedepot.com/cardbenefits to take advantage of 60-day payment terms and get more information on fuel savings including participating station
availability and how to order more redemption cards

*Refer to The Home Depot Returns Policy for details

Please note that if we received your pay by phone or online payment between 5 p.m. ET and midnight ET on the last day of your billing period, your 
payment will not be reflected until your next statement.

Please update your phone number, including cell phone number on the back of the payment coupon, or call customer service at 1-800-685-6691 to update.
By giving us your phone and/or cell number or a number later converted to a cell number, you agree that Citibank or its service providers can contact

 you at the number by autodialer, recorded or artificial voice, or text. Your phone plan charges may apply.

TRANSACTIONS
Trans Date Location/Description Reference # Invoice # Amount
08/16 THE HOME DEPOT ST. CLOUD  FL          5560954 $ 190.51

HARDWARE ELECTRICAL AND LIGHTING PAINT
08/31 THE HOME DEPOT ST. CLOUD  FL          20203 $ 101.82

HARDWARE MILLWORK ELECTRICAL AND LIGHTING
08/31 THE HOME DEPOT ST. CLOUD  FL      CREDIT          80518 $ 92.21-

HARDWARE ELECTRICAL AND LIGHTING
09/05 THE HOME DEPOT ST. CLOUD  FL          5060037 $ 189.97

HARDWARE ELECTRICAL AND LIGHTING MILLWORK

FINANCE CHARGE SUMMARY Your Annual Percentage Rate (APR) is the annual interest rate on your account.

 Type of Balance
Annual Percentage

 Rate (APR)
Daily Periodic

Rate
Balance Subject to

Finance Charge Finance Charge

PURCHASES
REGULAR REVOLVING CREDIT PLAN 21.99% 0.06024% $0.00 $0.00
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Page 4 of 6 1-800-685-6691   myhomedepotaccount.com

Account:  **** **** **** 5353 Invoice Page #22



Page 5 of 6 1-800-685-6691   myhomedepotaccount.com
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           Approved G v/d Snel 08/15/2017

Invoice Page #24



           Approved G v/d Snel 09/01/2017
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           Approved G v/d Snel 09/01/2017
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           Approved G v/d Snel 09/04/2017
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Account Statement
Commercial Account
HARMONY CDDCustomer Service:

myhomedepotaccount.com
Account Inquiries:
1-800-685-6691    Fax 1-800-266-7308

Payment Information
Current Due $0.00

Past Due Amount   + $0.00

Minimum Payment Due   = $0.00

Payment Due Date 09/03/17           

Summary of Account Activity
Previous Balance $267.86
Payments -$267.86
Credits -$69.91
Purchases +$0.00
Debits +$0.00
FINANCE CHARGES +$0.00
Late Fees +$0.00
New Balance $69.91CR

Send Notice of Billing Errors and Customer Service Inquiries to:
HOME DEPOT CREDIT SERVICES
PO Box 790345, St. Louis, MO 63179-0345

This Account is Issued by Citibank, N.A.NOTICE: SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR IMPORTANT INFORMATION Page 1 of 4  CL 3

HARMONY CDD
ACCOUNTS PAYABLE
STE 702
210 N UNIVERSITY DR
CORAL SPRINGS, FL   33071-7320

Statement Enclosed

Your Account Number is  xxxx xxxx xxxx 5353 

Payment Due Date September 3, 2017

New Balance $69.91 CR

Past Due Amount $0.00

Minimum Payment Due $0.00 

Print address changes on the reverse side.
Make Checks Payable to 

       Please detach and return lower portion with your payment  to insure proper credit.  Retain upper portion for your records.        

HOME DEPOT CREDIT SERVICES
DEPT. xx - xxxxxx5353
PO BOX 9001030
LOUISVILLE, KY  40290-1030

Account Number:  xxxx xxxx xxxx 5353 

Credit Limit $2,500
Credit Available         $2,500 
Closing Date 08/08/17
Next Closing Date 09/07/17

Days in Billing Period 32

SPECIAL NOTICE

Don't forget, 1-Year Returns credited back to your Home Depot Card*

Additional benefits available to Commercial Card Holders:
• 60-day Terms: Take 60 days to pay before finance charges start to bill on every qualifying purchase
• Fuel savings: Earn Fuel savings for every $100 of qualifying purchases madeusing your The Home Depot Commercial Revolving Card 

Visit homedepot.com/cardbenefits to take advantage of 60-day payment terms and get more information on fuel savings including participating station
availability and how to order more redemption cards

*Refer to The Home Depot Returns Policy for details

Your account has a credit balance that is owed to you. You may make charges against it if your account is open.øWe will send you a refund of any 
remaining balance of $1.00 or more after the balance has been on your account for 90 days or upon request made to the customer service address or 

phone number above.

Please update your phone number, including cell phone number on the back of the payment coupon, or call customer service at 1-800-685-6691 to update.
By giving us your phone and/or cell number or a number later converted to a cell number, you agree that Citibank or its service providers can contact

 you at the number by autodialer, recorded or artificial voice, or text. Your phone plan charges may apply.

TRANSACTIONS
Trans Date Location/Description Reference # Invoice # Amount
08/04 THE HOME DEPOT ST. CLOUD  FL      CREDIT          7090353 $ 69.91-

ELECTRICAL AND LIGHTING BUILDING MATERIALS  HARDWARE

PAYMENTS, CREDITS, FEES AND ADJUSTMENTS
08/01 PAY-BY-PHONE PAYMENT     DEERFIELD    IL   P9194006METFH60ER $ 267.86-
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Change of Address
Please print address changes in blue or black ink. 

Page 2 of 4

T10636 - CL - 9196-1400-0004-//- NOPLAY -//-  - 0 - N - 86 - 000 -//- P -  - 0 - N -//- 0 -  - 0 - 0 -//-  12/31/99 - 07/01/04 - July 7, 2017 -//-  - WC - 0 - 0 -
N -  -  -  -//- 0 -   -  - T09B 
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Page 3 of 4 1-800-685-6691   myhomedepotaccount.com
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Page 4 of 4 1-800-685-6691   myhomedepotaccount.com

Invoice Page #31



Please pay from this invoice.

INVOICE

NOTICE: SEE REVERSE SIDE FOR IMPORTANT INFORMATION This Account is Issued by Citibank, N.A..

       Please detach and return lower portion with your payment  to insure proper credit.  Retain upper portion for your records.        

Invoice Enclosed

Print address changes on the reverse side.
Make Checks Payable to 

Account xxxx xxxx xxxx 5353

Amount Due -$69.91

Transaction Date 08/04/17

Payment Due Date 09/03/17

Invoice #: 7090353

    

Page 1 of 4   4

HARMONY CDD
STE 702
210 N UNIVERSITY DR
CORAL SPRINGS, FL  33071-7320

Customer # Purchased By Authorized By Purchase Order/Job Name Customer Agreement #

Store / Register #: 6350, ST CLOUD

SHIP TO:

Your Account Number is  xxxx xxxx xxxx 5353 

Amount Due

Due Date

Invoice Number

-$69.91

September 3, 2017

7090353 

HOME DEPOT CREDIT SERVICES
DEPT. xx - xxxxxx5353
PO BOX 9001030
LOUISVILLE, KY  40290-1030

PRODUCT SKU # QUANTITY UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
HUSKY 100 FT. 16/2 OUTDOOR
EXTENSION

10015714950000300003 1.0000 EA $19.97- $19.97-

4'X100' ORANGE SAFETY
BARRIER FENCE

00001219690001300007 1.0000 RL $29.97- $29.97-

HUSKY 100 FT. 16/2 OUTDOOR
EXTENSION

10015714950000300003 1.0000 EA $19.97- $19.97-

HINGE, TEE_HD_6"_GALV_2PK 00003268950000400007 1.0000 EA $15.98- $15.98-

HINGE, TEE_HD_6"_GALV_2PK 00003268950000400007 1.0000 EA $15.98- $15.98-

HINGE, TEE_HD_6"_GALV_2PK 00003268950000400007 1.0000 EA $15.98- $15.98-

SUBTOTAL $117.85-
TAX $3.60-
SHIPPING $0.00
GIFT CERTIFICATE $51.54
TOTAL $69.91-

Please pay from this invoice.

           Approved G v/d Snel 10/09/2017
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Change of Address
Please print address changes in blue or black ink. 

Page 2 of 4

T10636 -  - 9196-1400-0004-//-  -//-  - 0 -  -  -  -//- P -  - 0 -  -//- 0 -  - 0 - 0 -//-   -  -  -//-  -  - 0 -  -
 -  -  -  -//-  -  -  -  

Invoice Page #33



INVOICE

Page 3 of 4 1-800-685-6691   myhomedepotaccount.com

Invoice #: 7090353 cont.

Account xxxx xxxx xxxx 5353

Transaction Date 08/04/17

Payment Due Date 09/03/17

Remit payment and make checks payable to:
HOME DEPOT CREDIT SERVICES
DEPT. xx - xxxxxx5353
PO BOX 9001030
LOUISVILLE, KY  40290-1030
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Kincaid	Inc.
Douglas	Mann
2400	Kincaid	St..
saint	cloud,	FL	34769
United	States

Tax	ID:	59-1534203

Phone:	407-908-1665
kincaidservices@outlook.com

Invoice	#:		1143
Invoice	Date:		Oct	3,	2017

Due	date:		Nov	2,	2017

Amount	due:
$125.00

INVOICE

Bill	To:
Harmony	Commuinity	Development	District
Harmony	
210	N.Univers ity	Drive
suite	702
Coral	Springs,	FL	32071
United	States

stmsapinvoices@stservices.com

Description Quantity Price Amount

Pumping	Holding	Tank	Once	A	Week 1 $125.00 $125.00

	 Subtotal $125.00

Total $125.00	USD

Notes
Thank	You	For	Your	Business!!

Terms	and	Conditions
Make	Checks	Payable	To:	Kincaid	Inc.	
Mailing	Address:	2400	Kincaid	Street	
Saint	Cloud	FL,	34769
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Phone: 321-939-4301 
E-mail: Gary@Moyer-Group.com 

313 Campus Street 
Celebration, FL 34747 

Moyer Management Group, Inc. 

INVOICE 

Harmony CDD 

ATTN: Sally Chalkley  

210 North University Drive, Suite 702 

Coral Springs, FL 33071 

Date Description Total 

July 27, 2017 Malware cleaning and firewall protection for website $ 62.00 

    Through September 27, 2017  

   

   

 TOTAL $ 62.00 

 

Please make your check payable to: 

 
Moyer Management Group, Inc. 
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1707 Townhurst Dr
Houston TX 77043
ar@poolsure.com
800-858-POOL (7665)
www.poolsure.com

Invoice Date 9/30/2017
Invoice # 101295576096

Bill To

Att: Willie Butler/AP
Harmony CDD
210 North University Drive
Coral Springs FL 33071

Ship To

Swim Club
Harmony CDD
7255 Five Oaks Drive
Harmony FL 34773

Terms Net 20

Due Date 10/20/2017

PO #
Delivery Ticket # Sales Order #1032137

Delivery Date 9/29/2017

Delivery Location Harmony Swim Club - Main Pool

Customer # 10HAR150

LATE FEE: This constitutes notice under the truth in lending act that any accounts remaining unpaid after the due date are subject to 1 1/2% per
month late charge and attorney fees.

Remittance Slip

Customer 10HAR150

Amount Paid _______________

Amount Due $375.00

Invoice # 101295576096
Make Checks Payable To
Poolsure
PO Box 55372
Houston, TX 77255-5372

Item ID
115-300

160-050

Item
Bleach Minibulk Delivered

Pool Acid bulk by Gallon

Quantity
220

15

Units
gal

gal

Rate
1.50

3.00

Amount
330.00

45.00

Total
Amount Due

375.00
$375.00

101295576096

           Approved G v/d Snel 10/03/2017

Invoice Page #91



1707 Townhurst Dr
Houston TX 77043
ar@poolsure.com
800-858-POOL (7665)
www.poolsure.com

Invoice Date 9/30/2017
Invoice # 101295576105

Bill To

Att: Willie Butler/AP
Harmony Com Development District
210 North University Drive
Pompano Beach FL 33071

Ship To

Harmony Ashley Park
7124 S Harmony Square Drive
Harmony FL 34773

Terms Net 20

Due Date 10/20/2017

PO #
Delivery Ticket # Sales Order #1032142

Delivery Date 9/29/2017

Delivery Location Ashley Park - Pool

Customer # 10HAR151

LATE FEE: This constitutes notice under the truth in lending act that any accounts remaining unpaid after the due date are subject to 1 1/2% per
month late charge and attorney fees.

Remittance Slip

Customer 10HAR151

Amount Paid _______________

Amount Due $390.00

Invoice # 101295576105
Make Checks Payable To
Poolsure
PO Box 55372
Houston, TX 77255-5372

Item ID
115-300

160-050

Item
Bleach Minibulk Delivered

Pool Acid bulk by Gallon

Quantity
200

30

Units
gal

gal

Rate
1.50

3.00

Amount
300.00

90.00

Total
Amount Due

390.00
$390.00

101295576105

           Approved G v/d Snel 10/03/2017
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1707 Townhurst Dr
Houston TX 77043
ar@poolsure.com
800-858-POOL (7665)
www.poolsure.com

Invoice Date 9/27/2017
Invoice # 101295575946

Bill To

Att: Willie Butler/AP
Harmony Com Development District
210 North University Drive
Pompano Beach FL 33071

Ship To

Harmony Ashley Park
7124 S Harmony Square Drive
Harmony FL 34773

Terms Net 20

Due Date 10/17/2017

PO #
Delivery Ticket # Sales Order #1031914

Delivery Date 9/21/2017

Delivery Location Ashley Park - Pool

Customer # 10HAR151

LATE FEE: This constitutes notice under the truth in lending act that any accounts remaining unpaid after the due date are subject to 1 1/2% per
month late charge and attorney fees.

Remittance Slip

Customer 10HAR151

Amount Paid _______________

Amount Due $187.50

Invoice # 101295575946
Make Checks Payable To
Poolsure
PO Box 55372
Houston, TX 77255-5372

Item ID
115-300

115-014

Item
Bleach Minibulk Delivered

25# Bag Celaperl

Quantity
75

3

Units
gal

Rate
1.50

25.00

Amount
112.50

75.00

Total
Amount Due

187.50
$187.50

101295575946

           Approved G v/d Snel 09/26/2017
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1707 Townhurst Dr
Houston TX 77043
ar@poolsure.com
800-858-POOL (7665)
www.poolsure.com

Invoice Date 9/11/2017
Invoice # 101295575252

Bill To

Att: Willie Butler/AP
Harmony Com Development District
210 North University Drive
Pompano Beach FL 33071

Ship To

Harmony Ashley Park
7124 S Harmony Square Drive
Harmony FL 34773

Terms Net 20

Due Date 10/1/2017

PO #
Delivery Ticket # Sales Order #1031545

Delivery Date 9/1/2017

Delivery Location Ashley Park - Pool

Customer # 10HAR151

LATE FEE: This constitutes notice under the truth in lending act that any accounts remaining unpaid after the due date are subject to 1 1/2% per
month late charge and attorney fees.

Remittance Slip

Customer 10HAR151

Amount Paid _______________

Amount Due $300.00

Invoice # 101295575252
Make Checks Payable To
Poolsure
PO Box 55372
Houston, TX 77255-5372

Item ID
115-300

Item
Bleach Minibulk Delivered

Quantity
200

Units
gal

Rate
1.50

Amount
300.00

Total
Amount Due

300.00
$300.00

101295575252

           Approved G v/d Snel 09/12/2017
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1707 Townhurst Dr
Houston TX 77043
ar@poolsure.com
800-858-POOL (7665)
www.poolsure.com

Invoice Date 5/30/2017
Invoice # 101295570992

Bill To

Att: Willie Butler/AP
Harmony CDD
210 North University Drive
Coral Springs FL 33071

Ship To

Swim Club
Harmony CDD
7255 Five Oaks Drive
Harmony FL 34773

Terms Net 20

Due Date 6/19/2017

PO #
Delivery Ticket # Sales Order #1028260

Delivery Date 5/2/2017

Delivery Location Harmony Swim Club - Main Pool

Customer # 10HAR150

LATE FEE: This constitutes notice under the truth in lending act that any accounts remaining unpaid after the due date are subject to 1 1/2% per
month late charge and attorney fees.

Remittance Slip

Customer 10HAR150

Amount Paid _______________

Amount Due $548.75

Invoice # 101295570992
Make Checks Payable To
Poolsure
PO Box 55372
Houston, TX 77255-5372

Item ID
115-300

115-014

115-300

160-050

Item
Bleach Minibulk Delivered

25# Bag Celaperl

Bleach Minibulk Delivered

Pool Acid bulk by Gallon

Quantity
250

2

22.5

30

Units
gal

gal

gal

Rate
1.50

25.00

1.50

3.00

Amount
375.00

50.00

33.75

90.00

Total
Amount Due

548.75
$548.75

101295570992
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1707 Townhurst Dr.
Houston TX 77043

Finance Charge Date 7/31/2017
Invoice # 101295574086

Bill To

Att: Willie Butler/AP
Harmony CDD
210 North University Drive
Coral Springs FL 33071

Terms Net 20

Due Date 8/20/2017

LATE FEE: This constitutes notice under the truth in lending act that any accounts remaining unpaid after the due date are subject to 1 1/2% per
month late charge and attorney fees.

Remittance Slip

Customer 10HAR150

Amount Paid _______________

Amount Due $9.31

Invoice # 101295574086
Make Checks Payable To
Poolsure
PO Box 55372
Houston, TX 77255-5372

Item
FinChrg

Description
Finance Charge on Overdue Balance
Invoice, Due Date, Amount
#101295567714, 5/21/2017, $60.00
#101295570992, 6/19/2017, $548.75

Amount
9.31

Total $9.31

101295574086
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1707 Townhurst Dr.
Houston TX 77043

Finance Charge Date 9/5/2017
Invoice # 101295575293

Bill To

Att: Willie Butler/AP
Harmony CDD
210 North University Drive
Coral Springs FL 33071

Terms Net 20

Due Date 9/25/2017

LATE FEE: This constitutes notice under the truth in lending act that any accounts remaining unpaid after the due date are subject to 1 1/2% per
month late charge and attorney fees.

Remittance Slip

Customer 10HAR150

Amount Paid _______________

Amount Due $9.74

Invoice # 101295575293
Make Checks Payable To
Poolsure
PO Box 55372
Houston, TX 77255-5372

Item
FinChrg

Description
Finance Charge on Overdue Balance
Invoice, Due Date, Amount
#101295570992, 6/19/2017, $548.75

Amount
9.74

Total $9.74

101295575293
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1707 Townhurst Dr
Houston TX 77043
ar@poolsure.com
800-858-POOL (7665)
www.poolsure.com

Invoice Date 9/20/2017
Invoice # 101295575706

Bill To

Att: Willie Butler/AP
Harmony CDD
210 North University Drive
Coral Springs FL 33071

Ship To

Swim Club
Harmony CDD
7255 Five Oaks Drive
Harmony FL 34773

Terms Net 20

Due Date 10/10/2017

PO #
Delivery Ticket # Sales Order #1031731

Delivery Date 9/15/2017

Delivery Location Harmony Swim Club - Main Pool

Customer # 10HAR150

LATE FEE: This constitutes notice under the truth in lending act that any accounts remaining unpaid after the due date are subject to 1 1/2% per
month late charge and attorney fees.

Remittance Slip

Customer 10HAR150

Amount Paid _______________

Amount Due $300.00

Invoice # 101295575706
Make Checks Payable To
Poolsure
PO Box 55372
Houston, TX 77255-5372

Item ID
115-300

Item
Bleach Minibulk Delivered

Quantity
200

Units
gal

Rate
1.50

Amount
300.00

Total
Amount Due

300.00
$300.00

101295575706
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DATE

9/20/2017

INVOICE #

119251

BILL TO
Harmony CDD
Accounts Payable
210 N University Drive
Suite 702
Coral Springs, FL 33071

SHIP TO
Harmony CDD
Attn: Gerhard/ Office Trailer
7360 Five Oaks Drive
Harmony, FL 34773
407-301-2235

P.O. NUMBER

GERHARD

TERMS

Net 30

DUE DATE

10/20/2017

REP

SV

SHIP

9/20/2017

VIA

UPS

F.O.B.

Orlando, FL

Balance Due

Subtotal
Sales Tax (0.0%)
Payments/Credits

TERMS: A late charge of 1.5% per month will be added on all overdue amounts. Fed TID# 20-4635153

2100 Principal Row, Suite 405
Orlando, FL  32837

Phone: 407-240-0953
E-Mail: info@dogipot.com

Thank you for your business!

ProPet Distributors Inc.
dba ProPet Distributors

ITEM CODE DESCRIPTIONQUANTITY RATE AMOUNT

1402-30 DOGIPOT SMART Litter Pick Up Bags, 200
Opaque Green, 8" x 13" bags per boxed roll - 30
Roll Case

10 168.00 1,680.00

S & H Shipping & Handling-FREE 0.00 0.00

$1,680.00

$1,680.00
$0.00

$0.00
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Invoice
Date

9/30/2017

Invoice #

145981

Bill To

Harmony CDD
C/O Severn Trent
210 North University Drive
Suite 702
Coral Springs, FL 33071

Service Address

313 Campus Street
Celebration, FL 34747

Servello & Son, Inc.
261 Springview Commerce Dr.

P.O. No.Due Date

10/30/2017

Rep

KG

Account #

30-13-0241

Project

3013-0241 Harmony ...

Balance Due

A finance charge of 1 1/2% per month (18% APR) will be
charged on all invoices over 30 days past due.

(386) 753-1100

Payments/Credits

Debary, FL 32713

DescriptionQuantity Rate Amount

Work completed as per proposal 35448:
Hurricane Irma Clean Up Complete

1 6,170.60 6,170.60

64.16 man hours ($55 per hour) = $3528.80
27.83 chainsaw hours ($35 per hour) = $974.05
2.25 bucket truck hours ($65 per hour) = $146.25
6.50 chipper hours ($55 per hour) = $357.50
2 debris removals = $1164.00

$6,170.60

$0.00
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